State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services
Construction & Properties Division

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:

Sanitary Sewer Lagoon Improvements

DCS Project #

14064

Project Location:

Greenleaf State Park - Cherokee County, OK

Bid Date:

10/10/2013

Using Agency:

Oklahoma Tourism and Recreation Department

Project Manager:

Richardson

SILVER SPUR CONSTRUCTION

Bidder's Name T MCDONALD CONSTRUCTION INC. COMPANY DUNCAN & SONS LLC
City, State EUFAULA, OK HASKELL, OK SAPULPA, OK
Notes

Bid Security|X Affidavits X Bid Security X Affidavits X |Bid SecurityX Affidavits X

Days 150 |Addendums |1 Days 150 |Addendums 1 |Days 150 |Addendums 1
Description Est. Qty. Unit Price Totals Est. Qty. Unit Price Totals Est. Qty. Unit Price Totals
Clearing & Grubbing 11l  $1,500.00| $16,500.00 11l $2,000.00f $22,000.00 11| $6,426.00] $70,686.00
Excavation 47318 $6.00| $283,908.00 47318 $8.00| $378,544.00 47,318 $6.35| $300,469.30
Rock Undercut 5455 $25.00| $136,375.00 5,455 $30.00| $163,650.00 5,455 $30.00| $163,650.00
Clay Layer 10,278 $15.00[ $154,170.00 10,278 $10.00| $102,780.00 10,278 $27.00 $277,506.00
Dike & Road Surface 3,935 $3.00] $11,805.00 3,935 $10.00] $39,350.00 3,935 $8.00 $31,480.00
Splash Pad 2 $150.00 $300.00 2 $500.00]  $1,000.00 2 $750.00 $1,500.00
Splitter Box 1] $8,000.00 $8,000.00 1] $10,000.00| $10,000.00 1| $6,000.00 $6,000.00
Elevation Marker 1 $500.00 $500.00 1] $2,000.00]  $2,000.00 1 $500.00 $500.00
Manhole 2| $2,500.00 $5,000.00 2| $5,000.00] $10,000.00 2| $2,500.00 $5,000.00
Top Soil 6,632 $12.00[ $79,584.00 6,632 $10.00 $66,320.00 6,632 $21.00[ $139,272.00
Solid Slab Sod 20,929 $2.50| $52,322.50 20,929 $2.00| $41,858.00 20,929 $2.48| $51,903.92
Hydromulch Seeding 1] $7,000.00 $7,000.00 1] $10,000.00| $10,000.00 1| $7,500.00 $7,500.00
Chainlink Fence 3115 $18.75|  $58,406.25 3,115 $24.00] $74,760.00 3,115 $20.46| $63,732.90
Iron Pipe 656 $60.00[  $39,360.00 656 $135.00] $88,560.00 656 $150.00  $98,400.00
2" PVC 380 $15.00 $5,700.00 380 $101.00| $38,380.00 380 $50.00 $19,000.00
4" pVC 248 $20.00 $4,960.00 248 $102.00] $25,296.00 248 $60.00[ $14,880.00
Flow Meter 1] $9,500.00 $9,500.00 1] $10,000.00| $10,000.00 1| $5,000.00 $5,000.00
Connection 1] $1,000.00 $1,000.00 1] $10,000.00| $10,000.00 1| $4,000.00 $4,000.00
Irrigation Inlet 1] $25,000.00f $25,000.00 1] $30,000.00| $30,000.00 1| $15,000.00| $15,000.00
Construction Staking 1] $5,000.00 $5,000.00 1] $20,000.00| $20,000.00 1| $10,000.00| $10,000.00
Mobilization 1] $30,000.00f $30,000.00 1] $50,000.00| $50,000.00 1| $41,000.00| $41,000.00
Total Bid Prices $934,390.75 $1,194,498.00 $1,326,480.12

ALTERNATES

Deduct 5139 $15.00| $77,085.00 5139 $8.00| $41,112.00 5139 NO BID
Ad1 833 $225.00 $187,425.00 833 NO BID 833 NO BID
Ad 2 20000 $1.50| $30,000.00] 20000 NO BID 2000 NO BID




State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services
Construction & Properties Division

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:

Sanitary Sewer Lagoon Improvements

DCS Project #

14064

Project Location:

Greenleaf State Park - Cherokee County, OK

Bid Date:

10/10/2013

Using Agency:

Oklahoma Tourism and Recreation Department

Project Manager:

Richardson

Bidder's Name

JERRY'S EXCAVATION INC.

HEMPHILL SERVICES, LLC

City, State HULBERT, OK BROKEN ARROW, OK
Notes

Bid Security]X Affidavits X Bid Security X Affidavits X

Days 150 |Addendums |1 Days 150 |Addendums 1
Description Est. Qty. Unit Price Totals Est. Qty. Unit Price Totals
Clearing & Grubbing 11f  $3,300.00| $36,300.00 11 $1,068.50| $11,753.50
Excavation 47318 $10.00 $473,180.00 47318 $16.03| $758,507.54
Rock Undercut 5455 $25.00| $136,375.00 5,455 $42.74| $233,146.70
Clay Layer 10,278 $25.00[ $256,950.00 10,278 $11.22| $115,319.16
Dike & Road Surface 3,935 $7.50] $29,512.50 3,935 $4.10| $16,133.50
Splash Pad 2| $1,000.00 $2,000.00 2l $1,602.80] $3,205.60
Splitter Box 1] $6,500.00 $6,500.00 1] $10,685.50| $10,685.50
Elevation Marker 1| $1,000.00 $1,000.00 1 $534.30 $534.30
Manhole 2| $3,000.00 $6,000.00 2| $5,409.50 $10,819.00
Top Soil 6,632 $25.00[ $165,800.00 6,632 $6.41| $42,511.12
Solid Slab Sod 20,929 $4.50|  $94,180.50 20,929 $2.80| $58,601.20
Hydromulch Seeding 1] $15,000.00f $15,000.00 1] $8,014.00] $8,014.00
Chainlink Fence 3115 $21.00|] $65,415.00 3,115 $12.72| $39,622.80
Iron Pipe 656 $152.00( $99,712.00 656 $153.21| $100,505.76
2" PVC 380 $15.00 $5,700.00 380 $18.42|  $6,999.60
4" pVC 248 $20.00 $4,960.00 248 $26.78|  $6,641.44
Flow Meter 1] $12,000.00f $12,000.00 11 $14,741.71] $14,741.71
Connection 1] $2,500.00 $2,500.00 1] $4,541.33] $4,541.33
Irrigation Inlet 1] $50,000.00f $50,000.00 1] $73,003.29| $73,003.29
Construction Staking 1| $15,000.00 $15,000.00 1 $3,205.65 $3,205.65
Mobilization 1] $50,000.00f $50,000.00 1] $16,028.24| $16,028.24
Total Bid Prices $1,528,085.00 $1,534,520.94

ALTERNATES

Deduct 5139 $15.00| $77,085.00 5139 $20.31| $104,373.09
Ad1 833 $240.00[ $199,920.00 833 $183.97| $153,247.01
Ad 2 20000 $2.20| $44,000.00] 20000 $0.84| $16,800.00




